BID NO. 2022-067 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR TACTICAL GEAR

Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply,

RG Beck AZ, Inc. dba TYR

Con10gency Consulting Inc. Tactical, LLC.
Selma, TX ’ . .
Titusville, FL Peoria, AZ
HUB - Yes
COOP - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
COOP - Yes COOP - Yes
Description EstQty |Price Per ltem| Extended Price |Price Per Item| Extended Price |Price Per ltem| Extended Price
Item 1 Tactical Entry Body Armor Carrier System
1a. Carrier Vest 30 $ 215209 | $ 64,562.70 | * no bid no bid $ 269113 | $ 80,733.90 | P
1b. Carrier " . .
Accessory Pouch 90 $ 2423 1% 2,180.70 no bid no bid $ 155.00 | $ 13,950.00 | P
Item 1 Total $ 66,743.40 no bid $ 94,683.90
S Ein L 58, e 40% no bid no bid 15%
Optional ltems
Item 2 Tactical Dual-Comm Communication Headset
Price Per Headset 15 no bid no bid $ 1,162.95| $17,444.25| P no bid no bid
Iltem 3 Tactical Helmet
Price Per Helmet 15 $ 54130 | $ 8141950 | P | & 562.89| % 8443.35| S no bid no bid
Item 4 Tactical Protective Gas Mask
Price Per Mask 16 $ 789.09 | $ 11,836.35| P | § 674.00 | $ 10,110.00 | ** no bid no bid

P = Primary Award Item 1 RG Beck AZ, Inc. dba TYR Tactical, LLC.
P = Primary Award ltem 2 Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc.

P = Primary Award Item 3 & 4 Con10gency Consulting

S = Secondary Award Item 3 Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc.

* = Con10gency Consulting did not meet specifications because Item 1 did not include Level [lIIA NIJ 06 Standard for Standard Ballistics in
the shoulder straps, or Level lll+ NIJ 06 Standard for Standard Ballistics rated chest and rear plates.
**= | awmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc. withdrew their bid for ltem 4.




